
Sun Jan 22, 2023

06:00 ESCAPE TO THE CHATEAU Captioned Repeat WS G

The Party Of A Lifetime 

It's the height of the summer. Dick and Angel are planning one of the year's biggest events, Angel's parents' 50th 
wedding anniversary, the party of a lifetime, with 100 guests.

07:00 GETAWAY Captioned Repeat WS PG

Scenic - AMBA #3 

This week on Getaway Nicky Buckley and husband Murray Bingham wind up their romantic Rhine and Moselle 
River cruise visiting Luxembourg, France and Germany's beautiful Black Forest. 

07:30 TINY HOUSE BIG LIVING Repeat WS G

Tiny Space, Growing Family 

A couple wants to downsize to a tiny home to focus on the important aspects of their growing family. Their builders 
are pushed to their limits, however, when they learn the couple's baby is coming early. 

08:00 OUR STATE ON A PLATE Captioned Repeat WS PG

Cass enjoys truffles at a trufferie in Pemberton and Brendan visits a citrus orchard in Harvey. Georgia joins another 
celebrated Chef in the kitchen and Erin is back with another wine tip. Plus, a taster of what's to come in next week's 
special episode!

08:30 ISLAND OF BRYAN Repeat WS PG

Hit the Roof 

Bryan and Sarah struggle to get some alone time; Bryan and Sarah make a decision about the opening date.

09:30 HOME TOWN Repeat WS G

The Zen Room 

A couple who wants to settle in Laurel and never move again is looking for a home with a zen-style room for 
relaxation and a porch for entertaining; Ben and Erin set out to create a Mexican-inspired home that will check 
everything off their list.

10:30 THE JENNIE GARTH PROJECT Repeat WS PG

An Odd Fit 

For Jennie, the kitchen is the heart of the house and she wants it to shine, but a couple odd angles make finding the 
center of this room difficult.

11:00 THE JENNIE GARTH PROJECT Repeat WS PG

A Room of One's Own 

For the first time in her life, Jennie is designing a master bedroom for one. She finds joy in personalizing her own 
space complete with a custom closet fit for a leading lady.

11:30 BEACHFRONT BARGAIN HUNT 
RENOVATION Repeat G

A Coastal Cottage in Hampton, Virginia 

A couple that dreams of raising their two sons along the shores of Hampton, Va. finds a waterfront property in need 
of serious updating.

12:30 WINDY CITY REHAB Repeat WS G

Family Ties 

While taking advantage of a real estate opportunity in Atlanta, Alison finds a willing co-investor in her older brother. 
Then, she gets to work completely transforming an outdated loft in one of the city's oldest buildings into a truly 
luxurious retreat.
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Sun Jan 22, 2023

13:30 YOU LIVE IN WHAT? Repeat WS G

Bank Barns and Firehouses 

From an Ohio bank barn and a New York schoolhouse to an Indiana firehouse.

14:30 TBA Captioned WS G

Information To Follow.

15:30 CARIBBEAN LIFE Repeat WS G

Letting Loose in St. Thomas 

A New Jersey couple, newly married, want to start their life together in St. Thomas. Seeking a large home with a 
rental unit for extra income, they need only agree on the budget.

16:00 CARIBBEAN LIFE Repeat WS G

Paddling Into a New Life on St. Thomas 

While they have agreed to buy a home on St. Thomas, a couple cannot agree whether the privacy and views should 
be a family home or a condo.

16:30 ESCAPE TO THE CHATEAU Captioned Repeat WS G

The Party Of A Lifetime 

It's the height of the summer. Dick and Angel are planning one of the year's biggest events, Angel's parents' 50th 
wedding anniversary, the party of a lifetime, with 100 guests.

17:30 HOUSE HUNTERS Repeat WS G

For the Love of Livestock in Georgia 

A real estate agent and house flipper searches for a new, modern farmhouse outside of Atlanta, Georgia.
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Sun Jan 22, 2023

18:00 HOUSE HUNTERS Repeat WS G

Dreams and Dollars Signs in Kansas City 

An engaged couple is eager to buy a home for their future family in the suburbs of Kansas City, Missouri.

18:30 HOUSE HUNTERS INTERNATIONAL Repeat WS G

Traveling Solo to Madrid 

A newly divorced woman looks to challenge herself and seeks adventure in Madrid, Spain. She's looking for a 
traditional Spanish neighbourhood with easy access to public transportation, but on her budget, there will need to be 
some compromises.

19:00 HOUSE HUNTERS INTERNATIONAL Repeat WS G

Succeeding in Scotland 

A woman accepted to a prestigious university moves to St. Andrews, Scotland, with her two children. She has spina 
bifida and needs an accessible, first floor residence with a stand-up shower, but finding the right place will be a 
challenge on her budget.

19:30 GOOD BONES WS PG

Budget-Busting Basic Bombshell 

Mina and Karen make a risky move and purchase a huge house in a relatively new neighborhood. With one budget-
busting issue after another, the team has to make money - saving design choices to create a neutral home that has 
bombshell appeal.

20:30 FLIP OR FLOP WS G

Time is Money 

In order to take advantage of a hot market, Tarek and Christina plan a quick flip for a small house on a big lot.; while 
their fast moves could land a big payday, they risk rushing the important details and creating bigger problems down 
the road.

21:30 UNSELLABLE HOUSES WS G

Cottage Vibe 

Three generations of women are eager to sell their over-customized and unfinished 1950s rambler before they find a 
new place near the ocean. Lyndsay and Leslie introduce the zen-like qualities of cottagecore style to create a cozy 
home like no other

22:30 HOUSE IN A HURRY Repeat WS PG

Feeling the Heat in Texas 

Professional cheerleader Courtney is hanging up her pompoms, and she and her husband, Dave, are relocating to 
Courtney's hometown of Fort Worth, Texas; they have one weekend to find a home before it gets snatched out from 
under them.

23:30 HOUSE HUNTERS Repeat WS G

Dreams and Dollars Signs in Kansas City 

An engaged couple is eager to buy a home for their future family in the suburbs of Kansas City, Missouri.

00:00 THE REAL HOUSEWIVES OF CHESHIRE WS MA

Don't Break the Lakes 

As the Housewives' trip to the Lake District continues, the birthday celebrations are interrupted by the ongoing fall-
out between Debbie and Nicole. Rachel faces her fears as she tackles both bees and ghosts.

Cons.Advice: Themes, Some Coarse Language, Sexual References
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01:00 FLIP OR FLOP Repeat WS G

Time is Money 

In order to take advantage of a hot market, Tarek and Christina plan a quick flip for a small house on a big lot.; while 
their fast moves could land a big payday, they risk rushing the important details and creating bigger problems down 
the road.

01:30 FLIP OR FLOP Repeat WS G

Century Flip 

Tarek and Christina take on a hundred-year-old house in a historic neighbourhood of Santa Ana, California, where 
they're faced with the challenges of preserving the home's original charm while modernizing it to today's standards.

02:00 OUR STATE ON A PLATE Captioned Repeat WS PG

Cass enjoys truffles at a trufferie in Pemberton and Brendan visits a citrus orchard in Harvey. Georgia joins another 
celebrated Chef in the kitchen and Erin is back with another wine tip. Plus, a taster of what's to come in next week's 
special episode!

02:30 GETAWAY Captioned Repeat WS PG

Scenic - AMBA #3 

This week on Getaway Nicky Buckley and husband Murray Bingham wind up their romantic Rhine and Moselle 
River cruise visiting Luxembourg, France and Germany's beautiful Black Forest. 

03:00 YOU LIVE IN WHAT? Repeat WS G

Bank Barns and Firehouses 

From an Ohio bank barn and a New York schoolhouse to an Indiana firehouse.

04:00 HOUSE IN A HURRY Repeat WS PG

Feeling the Heat in Texas 

Professional cheerleader Courtney is hanging up her pompoms, and she and her husband, Dave, are relocating to 
Courtney's hometown of Fort Worth, Texas; they have one weekend to find a home before it gets snatched out from 
under them.

04:30 HOUSE IN A HURRY Repeat WS PG

A Capital Move 

Kristi and David pack up their island home in Hawaii and move to Washington, D.C. during a global pandemic; 
David's job starts in a week, so there are just two days to find a home in one of the fastest moving real estate 
markets in the country.

05:00 MY LOTTERY DREAM HOME 
INTERNATIONAL Repeat WS G

Lottery of Love 

After scooping a win in the local Postcode Lottery, a couple's dreams can come true in the lake district. Laurence 
reveals the quaint charm of Ellesmere, England, and its surrounding villages as he narrows down the couple's very 
specific wish list.

05:30 MY LOTTERY DREAM HOME 
INTERNATIONAL Repeat WS G

A Dose of Luck 

Illness forced a man into early retirement and made his wife the sole breadwinner, but a lottery win has them moving 
out of their tiny apartment. They need Laurence's help as they search for a perfect home to start the life they never 
thought they'd have.
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Mon Jan 23, 2023

06:00 UNSELLABLE HOUSES Repeat WS G

Cottage Vibe 

Three generations of women are eager to sell their over-customized and unfinished 1950s rambler before they find a 
new place near the ocean. Lyndsay and Leslie introduce the zen-like qualities of cottagecore style to create a cozy 
home like no other

07:00 THE JENNIE GARTH PROJECT Repeat WS PG

An Odd Fit 

For Jennie, the kitchen is the heart of the house and she wants it to shine, but a couple odd angles make finding the 
center of this room difficult.

07:30 THE JENNIE GARTH PROJECT Repeat WS PG

A Room of One's Own 

For the first time in her life, Jennie is designing a master bedroom for one. She finds joy in personalizing her own 
space complete with a custom closet fit for a leading lady.

08:00 GOOD BONES Repeat WS PG

Budget-Busting Basic Bombshell 

Mina and Karen make a risky move and purchase a huge house in a relatively new neighborhood. With one budget-
busting issue after another, the team has to make money - saving design choices to create a neutral home that has 
bombshell appeal.

09:00 FLIP OR FLOP Repeat WS G

Time is Money 

In order to take advantage of a hot market, Tarek and Christina plan a quick flip for a small house on a big lot.; while 
their fast moves could land a big payday, they risk rushing the important details and creating bigger problems down 
the road.

09:30 FLIP OR FLOP Repeat WS G

Century Flip 

Tarek and Christina take on a hundred-year-old house in a historic neighbourhood of Santa Ana, California, where 
they're faced with the challenges of preserving the home's original charm while modernizing it to today's standards.

10:00 YOU LIVE IN WHAT? Repeat WS G

Bank Barns and Firehouses 

From an Ohio bank barn and a New York schoolhouse to an Indiana firehouse.

11:00 GETAWAY Captioned Repeat WS PG

Scenic - AMBA #3 

This week on Getaway Nicky Buckley and husband Murray Bingham wind up their romantic Rhine and Moselle 
River cruise visiting Luxembourg, France and Germany's beautiful Black Forest. 

11:30 OUR STATE ON A PLATE Captioned Repeat WS PG

Cass enjoys truffles at a trufferie in Pemberton and Brendan visits a citrus orchard in Harvey. Georgia joins another 
celebrated Chef in the kitchen and Erin is back with another wine tip. Plus, a taster of what's to come in next week's 
special episode!

12:00 HOUSE IN A HURRY Repeat WS PG

Feeling the Heat in Texas 

Professional cheerleader Courtney is hanging up her pompoms, and she and her husband, Dave, are relocating to 
Courtney's hometown of Fort Worth, Texas; they have one weekend to find a home before it gets snatched out from 
under them.

PLEASE NOTE: This document and its contents are embargoed until 9:00 AM Sunday 15 January 2023. 
This document is confidential and is the copyright of Nine Network Australia Pty. Ltd. This document or 
its contents must not be disclosed or released to any third party before the Embargo Date.

Page 5 of 29

Sydney Program Guide



Mon Jan 23, 2023

12:30 HOUSE IN A HURRY Repeat WS PG

A Capital Move 

Kristi and David pack up their island home in Hawaii and move to Washington, D.C. during a global pandemic; 
David's job starts in a week, so there are just two days to find a home in one of the fastest moving real estate 
markets in the country.

13:00 FLIP OR FLOP Repeat WS G

Time is Money 

In order to take advantage of a hot market, Tarek and Christina plan a quick flip for a small house on a big lot.; while 
their fast moves could land a big payday, they risk rushing the important details and creating bigger problems down 
the road.

13:30 UNSELLABLE HOUSES Repeat WS G

Cottage Vibe 

Three generations of women are eager to sell their over-customized and unfinished 1950s rambler before they find a 
new place near the ocean. Lyndsay and Leslie introduce the zen-like qualities of cottagecore style to create a cozy 
home like no other

14:30 THE BLOCK Captioned Repeat WS PG

Master Ensuite Reveal 

The teams have overcome hurdles to produce some of the best bathrooms ever. Find out who wins and takes home 
the $10,000 cash.

Cons.Advice: Mild Coarse Language

16:00 BLOG CABIN G

Blog Cabin 2016: Kitchen Crashers 

Alison Victoria transforms the kitchen at Blog Cabin 2016, turning a blank slate into a masterpiece.

16:30 TINY HOUSE BIG LIVING Repeat WS G

Tiny Cowboy House 

Rob and Sandi spend most of their free time on a ranch just outside of Las Vegas. Rob has built one tiny home 
before, so he's prepared to tackle a new one with handcrafted features, including a rooftop deck and a hitching post.

17:00 GOOD BONES Repeat WS PG

Budget-Busting Basic Bombshell 

Mina and Karen make a risky move and purchase a huge house in a relatively new neighborhood. With one budget-
busting issue after another, the team has to make money - saving design choices to create a neutral home that has 
bombshell appeal.
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Mon Jan 23, 2023

18:00 HOUSE HUNTERS INTERNATIONAL Repeat WS G

His Plan vs. Her Priorities in Brazil 

A blended family is going to Sao Paulo, Brazil, for a job promotion and he wants to stay on budget, but she wants to 
spend whatever it takes to ensure there is enough room for the entire family to feel comfy.

18:30 HOUSE HUNTERS INTERNATIONAL Repeat WS G

Searching for Simplicity in San Ramon 

A pair of professional chefs want to reconnect as family in San Ramon, Costa Rica. They're looking for something 
furnished with an outdoor space for their son, but finding the right location will be a challenge on their budget.

19:00 HOUSE HUNTERS Repeat WS G

Vacation Home Battle in Arizona 

A couple seeks a vacation home they can also rent out near Scottsdale, Ariz.; he is thrifty and wants a fixer-upper 
with character and strong income potential, while she is more extravagant, preferring a turnkey property with an 
open floor plan.

19:30 HOUSE HUNTERS WS G

Close to Town or Out in the Country 

A Redding, CA, couple with two daughters are eager to move out of her parents' home and find their own place. He 
wants a fixer-upper in the country with lots of land, but she prefers a move-in ready in town that's close to her family.

20:00 HOUSE HUNTERS WS G

Turning a Negative Into a Positive 

A North Carolina couple makes the best of a negative situation by buying their first home after being displaced from 
their rental by a hurricane. However, she wants to settle down in a move-in ready home, but he's looking to build 
equity in a fixer.

20:30 BARGAIN BLOCK WS G

Wild West and Vintage Circus 

Cowboy hat in hand, Keith draws from his Texas roots to load up the Wild West house with cowhide, canyons and 
rustic wood galore. 

21:30 RESCUE MY RENOVATION WS PG

Steel-ing Dreams 

John must act swiftly after realizing that a sinking kitchen floor is jeopardizing the safety of a young family, and he 
races to prevent the floor from falling into the basement.

22:30 WINDY CITY REHAB WS G

Change of Scenery 

Alison joins forces with a husband-and-wife realtor team to restore a three-bedroom Spanish Revival in California's 
Hollywood Hills. She takes on a complete gut rehab after the grand property sat empty for years in this historic and 
iconic neighbourhood.

23:30 THE REAL HOUSEWIVES OF NEW YORK WS M

Ho Ho Holidays 

The morning after Ramona and Sonja's birthday bash, Luann and Ramona learn about Sonja's late-night escapades 
with one of the party guests. Leah reconnects with her siblings for the first time since their grandmother's funeral, 
and Eboni and her potential sister, Ashley, receive their DNA results. Later on, the ladies get glammed up for 
Luann's music video shoot, where the truth about Sonja's birthday hookup is revealed.

Cons.Advice: Some Coarse Language, Sexual References
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Mon Jan 23, 2023

00:30 THE BRADSHAW BUNCH WS PG

Horse Shows and Hot Sauce 

Zurie competes in a horse show against Terry and Tammy, with a high stakes bet on the line. Terry helps Lacey's 
husband Noah sell his homemade hot sauce by having the entire family shoot a homemade commercial.

Cons.Advice: Some Coarse Language, Sexual References

01:00 THE BRADSHAW BUNCH WS PG

Hometown Hero 

The mayor of Terry's hometown offers to present him with the key to the city. The Bradshaw Bunch head down 
south for a trip down memory lane. As Terry revisits his past, his daughters see him in a new light.

Cons.Advice: Some Coarse Language

01:30 HOUSE HUNTERS INTERNATIONAL Repeat WS G

His Plan vs. Her Priorities in Brazil 

A blended family is going to Sao Paulo, Brazil, for a job promotion and he wants to stay on budget, but she wants to 
spend whatever it takes to ensure there is enough room for the entire family to feel comfy.

02:00 BARGAIN BLOCK Repeat WS G

Wild West and Vintage Circus 

Cowboy hat in hand, Keith draws from his Texas roots to load up the Wild West house with cowhide, canyons and 
rustic wood galore. 

03:00 THE REAL HOUSEWIVES OF CHESHIRE Repeat WS MA

Don't Break the Lakes 

As the Housewives' trip to the Lake District continues, the birthday celebrations are interrupted by the ongoing fall-
out between Debbie and Nicole. Rachel faces her fears as she tackles both bees and ghosts.

Cons.Advice: Themes, Some Coarse Language, Sexual References

04:00 RESCUE MY RENOVATION Repeat WS PG

Steel-ing Dreams 

John must act swiftly after realizing that a sinking kitchen floor is jeopardizing the safety of a young family, and he 
races to prevent the floor from falling into the basement.

04:30 RESCUE MY RENOVATION Repeat WS PG

Coping With a Con Man 

A young couple copes with water damage and mould in their bedroom after being overcharged for unsightly 
patchwork that leaves them with even more water.

05:00 BLOG CABIN Repeat G

Blog Cabin 2016: Kitchen Crashers 

Alison Victoria transforms the kitchen at Blog Cabin 2016, turning a blank slate into a masterpiece.

05:30 TINY HOUSE BIG LIVING Repeat WS G

Tiny Cowboy House 

Rob and Sandi spend most of their free time on a ranch just outside of Las Vegas. Rob has built one tiny home 
before, so he's prepared to tackle a new one with handcrafted features, including a rooftop deck and a hitching post.
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Tue Jan 24, 2023

06:00 HOUSE HUNTERS INTERNATIONAL Repeat WS G

Searching for Simplicity in San Ramon 

A pair of professional chefs want to reconnect as family in San Ramon, Costa Rica. They're looking for something 
furnished with an outdoor space for their son, but finding the right location will be a challenge on their budget.

06:30 HOUSE HUNTERS Repeat WS G

Vacation Home Battle in Arizona 

A couple seeks a vacation home they can also rent out near Scottsdale, Ariz.; he is thrifty and wants a fixer-upper 
with character and strong income potential, while she is more extravagant, preferring a turnkey property with an 
open floor plan.

07:00 WINDY CITY REHAB Repeat WS G

Change of Scenery 

Alison joins forces with a husband-and-wife realtor team to restore a three-bedroom Spanish Revival in California's 
Hollywood Hills. She takes on a complete gut rehab after the grand property sat empty for years in this historic and 
iconic neighbourhood.

08:00 THE BLOCK Captioned Repeat WS PG

Master Ensuite Reveal 

The teams have overcome hurdles to produce some of the best bathrooms ever. Find out who wins and takes home 
the $10,000 cash.

Cons.Advice: Mild Coarse Language

09:30 HOUSE HUNTERS INTERNATIONAL Repeat WS G

His Plan vs. Her Priorities in Brazil 

A blended family is going to Sao Paulo, Brazil, for a job promotion and he wants to stay on budget, but she wants to 
spend whatever it takes to ensure there is enough room for the entire family to feel comfy.

10:00 HOUSE HUNTERS INTERNATIONAL Repeat WS G

Searching for Simplicity in San Ramon 

A pair of professional chefs want to reconnect as family in San Ramon, Costa Rica. They're looking for something 
furnished with an outdoor space for their son, but finding the right location will be a challenge on their budget.

10:30 HOUSE HUNTERS Repeat WS G

Vacation Home Battle in Arizona 

A couple seeks a vacation home they can also rent out near Scottsdale, Ariz.; he is thrifty and wants a fixer-upper 
with character and strong income potential, while she is more extravagant, preferring a turnkey property with an 
open floor plan.

11:00 BLOG CABIN Repeat G

Blog Cabin 2016: Kitchen Crashers 

Alison Victoria transforms the kitchen at Blog Cabin 2016, turning a blank slate into a masterpiece.

11:30 TINY HOUSE BIG LIVING Repeat WS G

Tiny Cowboy House 

Rob and Sandi spend most of their free time on a ranch just outside of Las Vegas. Rob has built one tiny home 
before, so he's prepared to tackle a new one with handcrafted features, including a rooftop deck and a hitching post.
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Tue Jan 24, 2023

12:00 BARGAIN BLOCK Repeat WS G

Wild West and Vintage Circus 

Cowboy hat in hand, Keith draws from his Texas roots to load up the Wild West house with cowhide, canyons and 
rustic wood galore. 

13:00 HOUSE HUNTERS Repeat WS G

Close to Town or Out in the Country 

A Redding, CA, couple with two daughters are eager to move out of her parents' home and find their own place. He 
wants a fixer-upper in the country with lots of land, but she prefers a move-in ready in town that's close to her family.

13:30 HOUSE HUNTERS Repeat WS G

Turning a Negative Into a Positive 

A North Carolina couple makes the best of a negative situation by buying their first home after being displaced from 
their rental by a hurricane. However, she wants to settle down in a move-in ready home, but he's looking to build 
equity in a fixer.

14:00 WINDY CITY REHAB Repeat WS G

Change of Scenery 

Alison joins forces with a husband-and-wife realtor team to restore a three-bedroom Spanish Revival in California's 
Hollywood Hills. She takes on a complete gut rehab after the grand property sat empty for years in this historic and 
iconic neighbourhood.

15:00 THE BLOCK Captioned Repeat WS PG

Bedroom & Bathroom Week 

Get your tissues ready for the most emotional episode of The Block ever. 

Cons.Advice: Mild Coarse Language

16:00 BLOG CABIN G

Blog Cabin 2016: Master Suite Remodel 

Josh Temple stops by the Blog Cabin 2016 to turn its large master bedroom suite into an oasis; Josh and Chris 
Grundy put in a new bathroom with a steam shower, custom doors with reclaimed wood and an outdoor fire feature.

16:30 BEACHFRONT BARGAIN HUNT Repeat WS G

A Gulf Shores Getaway 

A Mobile, Ala. couple loves traveling back to where they were engaged on the fabulous beaches on the Gulf Shores, 
and think it would be a great place to get together with their friends in a place of their own.

17:00 RESCUE MY RENOVATION Repeat WS PG

Steel-ing Dreams 

John must act swiftly after realizing that a sinking kitchen floor is jeopardizing the safety of a young family, and he 
races to prevent the floor from falling into the basement.

17:30 RESCUE MY RENOVATION Repeat WS PG

Coping With a Con Man 

A young couple copes with water damage and mould in their bedroom after being overcharged for unsightly 
patchwork that leaves them with even more water.
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Tue Jan 24, 2023

18:00 HOUSE HUNTERS INTERNATIONAL Repeat WS G

Follow Me to Barcelona 

Young newlyweds move to Barcelona, Spain, so she can pursue her master's degree. He is hoping she'll follow his 
lead on the hunt for a place with Spanish flare and love.

18:30 HOUSE HUNTERS INTERNATIONAL Repeat WS G

Lower Costs, Higher Living in Boquete, Panama 

A young family aggressively saves and looks to make a new start in Boquete, Panama; she prefers a larger house 
with three bedrooms, but he's more budget-minded and wants something smaller that's closer to town.

19:00 HOUSE HUNTERS Repeat WS G

Mother Knows Best in Virginia 

A U.S. Air Force officer is on his way to a new assignment in Hampton, Va., and he's set on buying a big, move-in-
ready home; however, his mother comes along to gently push him towards a fixer-upper that won't break the bank.

19:30 SARAH BEENY'S LITTLE HOUSE BIG 
PLANS WS G

Can Becca and Dan finish their year-long project before baby number two arrives? 

20:30 OUR YORKSHIRE FARM WS PG

The children are off school for the Easter holidays. Lambing time has just begun and the children help Amanda set 
up the lambing 'hospital shed' and deliver a pair of twins who are stuck. But Kate the sheepdog suffers a 
miscarriage.

Cons.Advice: Themes

21:30 FARMHOUSE FACELIFT WS G

Farmhouse Dream Come True 

Billy and Carolyn transform a tired farmhouse into the perfect place to host family and friends.

22:30 BEACHFRONT BARGAIN HUNT Repeat WS G

Grooving in Gulfport 

Angela wants a change of scenery and while weighing her options, she remembers a family vacation in Gulfport, 
Mississippi, and immediately decides it would be the perfect city for a fresh start.

23:30 HOUSE HUNTERS INTERNATIONAL Repeat WS G

Follow Me to Barcelona 

Young newlyweds move to Barcelona, Spain, so she can pursue her master's degree. He is hoping she'll follow his 
lead on the hunt for a place with Spanish flare and love.

00:00 THE REAL HOUSEWIVES OF BEVERLY 
HILLS Repeat WS M

Showdown at Villa Rosa 

Denise and Aaron begin their life together by nesting at home; Dorit deals with the repercussions of the dog fiasco; a 
monster argument breaks out between Kyle and Lisa Vanderpump culminating in Lisa and Ken demanding that Kyle 
leave their house.

Cons.Advice: Some Coarse Language, Sexual References

01:00 SARAH BEENY'S LITTLE HOUSE BIG 
PLANS Repeat WS G

Can Becca and Dan finish their year-long project before baby number two arrives? 
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Tue Jan 24, 2023

02:00 OUR YORKSHIRE FARM Repeat WS PG

The children are off school for the Easter holidays. Lambing time has just begun and the children help Amanda set 
up the lambing 'hospital shed' and deliver a pair of twins who are stuck. But Kate the sheepdog suffers a 
miscarriage.

Cons.Advice: Themes

03:00 FARMHOUSE FACELIFT Repeat WS G

Farmhouse Dream Come True 

Billy and Carolyn transform a tired farmhouse into the perfect place to host family and friends.

04:00 THE REAL HOUSEWIVES OF NEW YORK Repeat WS M

Ho Ho Holidays 

The morning after Ramona and Sonja's birthday bash, Luann and Ramona learn about Sonja's late-night escapades 
with one of the party guests. Leah reconnects with her siblings for the first time since their grandmother's funeral, 
and Eboni and her potential sister, Ashley, receive their DNA results. Later on, the ladies get glammed up for 
Luann's music video shoot, where the truth about Sonja's birthday hookup is revealed.

Cons.Advice: Some Coarse Language, Sexual References

05:00 BLOG CABIN Repeat G

Blog Cabin 2016: Master Suite Remodel 

Josh Temple stops by the Blog Cabin 2016 to turn its large master bedroom suite into an oasis; Josh and Chris 
Grundy put in a new bathroom with a steam shower, custom doors with reclaimed wood and an outdoor fire feature.

05:30 BEACHFRONT BARGAIN HUNT Repeat WS G

A Gulf Shores Getaway 

A Mobile, Ala. couple loves traveling back to where they were engaged on the fabulous beaches on the Gulf Shores, 
and think it would be a great place to get together with their friends in a place of their own.
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Wed Jan 25, 2023

06:00 HOUSE HUNTERS INTERNATIONAL Repeat WS G

Lower Costs, Higher Living in Boquete, Panama 

A young family aggressively saves and looks to make a new start in Boquete, Panama; she prefers a larger house 
with three bedrooms, but he's more budget-minded and wants something smaller that's closer to town.

06:30 HOUSE HUNTERS Repeat WS G

Mother Knows Best in Virginia 

A U.S. Air Force officer is on his way to a new assignment in Hampton, Va., and he's set on buying a big, move-in-
ready home; however, his mother comes along to gently push him towards a fixer-upper that won't break the bank.

07:00 BEACHFRONT BARGAIN HUNT Repeat WS G

Grooving in Gulfport 

Angela wants a change of scenery and while weighing her options, she remembers a family vacation in Gulfport, 
Mississippi, and immediately decides it would be the perfect city for a fresh start.

07:30 BEACHFRONT BARGAIN HUNT Repeat WS G

Savings on San Juan Islands 

Sybil and Travis live and work on the San Juan Islands, and give up their vacation property in Cabo San Lucas to 
have a getaway in their own backyard.

08:00 THE GARDEN GURUS Captioned Repeat WS G

The Garden Gurus is back for another series with the rescue of a garden destroyed by council. The Gurus restore it 
and share tips to meeting council regulations. We also features stories on the Victorian State Rose Garden.

08:30 THE BLOCK Captioned Repeat WS PG

Bedroom & Bathroom Week 

Get your tissues ready for the most emotional episode of The Block ever. 

Cons.Advice: Mild Coarse Language

09:30 HOUSE HUNTERS INTERNATIONAL Repeat WS G

Follow Me to Barcelona 

Young newlyweds move to Barcelona, Spain, so she can pursue her master's degree. He is hoping she'll follow his 
lead on the hunt for a place with Spanish flare and love.

10:00 HOUSE HUNTERS INTERNATIONAL Repeat WS G

Lower Costs, Higher Living in Boquete, Panama 

A young family aggressively saves and looks to make a new start in Boquete, Panama; she prefers a larger house 
with three bedrooms, but he's more budget-minded and wants something smaller that's closer to town.

10:30 HOUSE HUNTERS Repeat WS G

Mother Knows Best in Virginia 

A U.S. Air Force officer is on his way to a new assignment in Hampton, Va., and he's set on buying a big, move-in-
ready home; however, his mother comes along to gently push him towards a fixer-upper that won't break the bank.

11:00 FARMHOUSE FACELIFT Repeat WS G

Farmhouse Dream Come True 

Billy and Carolyn transform a tired farmhouse into the perfect place to host family and friends.
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Wed Jan 25, 2023

12:00 YOU LIVE IN WHAT? Repeat WS G

Bank Barns and Firehouses 

From an Ohio bank barn and a New York schoolhouse to an Indiana firehouse.

13:00 SARAH BEENY'S LITTLE HOUSE BIG 
PLANS Repeat WS G

Can Becca and Dan finish their year-long project before baby number two arrives? 

14:00 BEACHFRONT BARGAIN HUNT Repeat WS G

Grooving in Gulfport 

Angela wants a change of scenery and while weighing her options, she remembers a family vacation in Gulfport, 
Mississippi, and immediately decides it would be the perfect city for a fresh start.

14:30 BEACHFRONT BARGAIN HUNT Repeat WS G

Savings on San Juan Islands 

Sybil and Travis live and work on the San Juan Islands, and give up their vacation property in Cabo San Lucas to 
have a getaway in their own backyard.

15:00 THE BLOCK Captioned Repeat WS PG

Bedroom & Bathroom Week 

The teams are back at The Block after COVID-19 shutdown. Will dirty Harry pay for the price for being sneaky?

Cons.Advice: Mild Coarse Language

16:00 BLOG CABIN G

Blog Cabin 2016: Fish Tank Living Room 

Josh Temple crashes Blog Cabin 2016 to give the living and dining rooms the ultimate remodel; he customizes the 
space with a fish tank room divider that resembles a fish, a live-edge dining table and a art-piece coffee table.

16:30 BEACHFRONT BARGAIN HUNT Repeat WS G

Our Own Margate City Retreat 

After staying with friends in Margate City, N.J., a busy Philadelphia couple decides it's time to find a place of their 
own.

17:00 OUR YORKSHIRE FARM Repeat WS PG

The children are off school for the Easter holidays. Lambing time has just begun and the children help Amanda set 
up the lambing 'hospital shed' and deliver a pair of twins who are stuck. But Kate the sheepdog suffers a 
miscarriage.

Cons.Advice: Themes
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Wed Jan 25, 2023

18:00 HOUSE HUNTERS INTERNATIONAL Repeat WS G

Strangers Search for Paradise 

Two strangers have agreed to pool their resources together to achieve their dream of living on St. Thomas. But, they 
can't agree on their island home.

18:30 HOUSE HUNTERS INTERNATIONAL Repeat WS G

Embattled in Essex, UK 

Inspired after a family loss, a young couple seizes the day and moves to Essex, England. They're looking for a pet-
friendly place for their dog, but she's concerned about their budget while he doesn't mind spending more to get 
British charm.

19:00 HOUSE HUNTERS Repeat WS G

Adulting in Ithaca 

Two twentysomethings buy their first house in Ithaca, N.Y.; she wants a move-in-ready home, but he wants to put 
his construction skills to the test on a fixer-upper.

19:30 HOLMES FAMILY RESCUE WS PG

Color Crisis 

The Holmes family steps up when their electrician and good friend, Frank, gets overwhelmed with his renovation 
due to a series of health issues; The design choices and fun finishes at a client's bungalow leave Mike having a 
crisis of colour.

20:30 HOME TOWN WS G

Campy Cabin Vibes 

After being a travel nurse, Luke wants his home base to be in his hometown; Ben and Erin transform his starter 
house into a comfortable home featuring a cozy cabin design that includes his grandma's mementos.

21:30 THE NATE AND JEREMIAH HOME 
PROJECT WS G

Every Dollar Counts Project 

A couple fell for the original charm of a crumbly 1920s colonial, but they need Nate and Jeremiah's help to make it 
functional for their family; before renovations begin, the duo must determine what stays from a collection of hand-
me-down furniture.

22:30 CARIBBEAN LIFE Repeat WS G

Family Time in the Sun on Vieques 

Leaving the Minnesota cold behind, an active couple moves to Vieques, Puerto Rico. With three boys they need a 
home with plenty of room. The only question is rural, or close to town?

23:30 MILLION DOLLAR LISTING NY WS M

Escape From New York 

When the city shuts down, the agents document their lives in lockdown. As the city opens back up, the agents learn 
how to navigate a new world – and a new market. 

Cons.Advice: Some Coarse Language

00:30 HOUSE HUNTERS INTERNATIONAL Repeat WS G

Strangers Search for Paradise 

Two strangers have agreed to pool their resources together to achieve their dream of living on St. Thomas. But, they 
can't agree on their island home.
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Wed Jan 25, 2023

01:00 HOLMES FAMILY RESCUE Repeat WS PG

Color Crisis 

The Holmes family steps up when their electrician and good friend, Frank, gets overwhelmed with his renovation 
due to a series of health issues; The design choices and fun finishes at a client's bungalow leave Mike having a 
crisis of colour.

02:00 HOME TOWN Repeat WS G

Campy Cabin Vibes 

After being a travel nurse, Luke wants his home base to be in his hometown; Ben and Erin transform his starter 
house into a comfortable home featuring a cozy cabin design that includes his grandma's mementos.

03:00 THE NATE AND JEREMIAH HOME 
PROJECT Repeat WS G

Every Dollar Counts Project 

A couple fell for the original charm of a crumbly 1920s colonial, but they need Nate and Jeremiah's help to make it 
functional for their family; before renovations begin, the duo must determine what stays from a collection of hand-
me-down furniture.

04:00 CARIBBEAN LIFE Repeat WS G

Family Time in the Sun on Vieques 

Leaving the Minnesota cold behind, an active couple moves to Vieques, Puerto Rico. With three boys they need a 
home with plenty of room. The only question is rural, or close to town?

04:30 CARIBBEAN LIFE Repeat WS G

Bringing Southern Charm to Vieques, Puerto Rico 

Swapping the country roads of West Virginia for the Vieques, Puerto Rico beaches, a southern couple try to reach 
agreement on a private, remote fixer upper, or a turn key property close to town.

05:00 BLOG CABIN Repeat G

Blog Cabin 2016: Fish Tank Living Room 

Josh Temple crashes Blog Cabin 2016 to give the living and dining rooms the ultimate remodel; he customizes the 
space with a fish tank room divider that resembles a fish, a live-edge dining table and a art-piece coffee table.

05:30 BEACHFRONT BARGAIN HUNT Repeat WS G

Our Own Margate City Retreat 

After staying with friends in Margate City, N.J., a busy Philadelphia couple decides it's time to find a place of their 
own.
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Thu Jan 26, 2023

06:00 HOUSE HUNTERS INTERNATIONAL Repeat WS G

Embattled in Essex, UK 

Inspired after a family loss, a young couple seizes the day and moves to Essex, England. They're looking for a pet-
friendly place for their dog, but she's concerned about their budget while he doesn't mind spending more to get 
British charm.

06:30 HOUSE HUNTERS Repeat WS G

Adulting in Ithaca 

Two twentysomethings buy their first house in Ithaca, N.Y.; she wants a move-in-ready home, but he wants to put 
his construction skills to the test on a fixer-upper.

07:00 YOU LIVE IN WHAT? Repeat WS G

Bank Barns and Firehouses 

From an Ohio bank barn and a New York schoolhouse to an Indiana firehouse.

08:00 THE GARDEN GURUS Captioned Repeat WS G

The team go to the rescue of a Facebook friend, Trev shows a cost effective straw bale veggie garden project and 
we showcase another of Irelands beautiful gardens. A lucky viewer will win a trip for two to Ireland to experience its 
incredible beauty.

08:30 THE BLOCK Captioned Repeat WS PG

Bedroom & Bathroom Week 

The teams are back at The Block after COVID-19 shutdown. Will dirty Harry pay for the price for being sneaky?

Cons.Advice: Mild Coarse Language

09:30 HOUSE HUNTERS INTERNATIONAL Repeat WS G

Strangers Search for Paradise 

Two strangers have agreed to pool their resources together to achieve their dream of living on St. Thomas. But, they 
can't agree on their island home.

10:00 HOUSE HUNTERS INTERNATIONAL Repeat WS G

Embattled in Essex, UK 

Inspired after a family loss, a young couple seizes the day and moves to Essex, England. They're looking for a pet-
friendly place for their dog, but she's concerned about their budget while he doesn't mind spending more to get 
British charm.

10:30 HOUSE HUNTERS Repeat WS G

Adulting in Ithaca 

Two twentysomethings buy their first house in Ithaca, N.Y.; she wants a move-in-ready home, but he wants to put 
his construction skills to the test on a fixer-upper.

11:00 BLOG CABIN Repeat G

Blog Cabin 2016: Fish Tank Living Room 

Josh Temple crashes Blog Cabin 2016 to give the living and dining rooms the ultimate remodel; he customizes the 
space with a fish tank room divider that resembles a fish, a live-edge dining table and a art-piece coffee table.
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Thu Jan 26, 2023

11:30 BEACHFRONT BARGAIN HUNT Repeat WS G

Our Own Margate City Retreat 

After staying with friends in Margate City, N.J., a busy Philadelphia couple decides it's time to find a place of their 
own.

12:00 HOME TOWN Repeat WS G

Campy Cabin Vibes 

After being a travel nurse, Luke wants his home base to be in his hometown; Ben and Erin transform his starter 
house into a comfortable home featuring a cozy cabin design that includes his grandma's mementos.

13:00 CARIBBEAN LIFE Repeat WS G

Family Time in the Sun on Vieques 

Leaving the Minnesota cold behind, an active couple moves to Vieques, Puerto Rico. With three boys they need a 
home with plenty of room. The only question is rural, or close to town?

13:30 CARIBBEAN LIFE Repeat WS G

Bringing Southern Charm to Vieques, Puerto Rico 

Swapping the country roads of West Virginia for the Vieques, Puerto Rico beaches, a southern couple try to reach 
agreement on a private, remote fixer upper, or a turn key property close to town.

14:00 HOLMES FAMILY RESCUE Repeat WS PG

Color Crisis 

The Holmes family steps up when their electrician and good friend, Frank, gets overwhelmed with his renovation 
due to a series of health issues; The design choices and fun finishes at a client's bungalow leave Mike having a 
crisis of colour.

15:00 THE BLOCK Captioned Repeat WS PG

Bedroom & Bathroom Week 

Luke and Jasmin are having a very bad day while Sarah and George have returned raring to go, Dan is shocked.

Cons.Advice: Mild Coarse Language

16:00 BLOG CABIN G

Blog Cabin 2016: Lower Lounge 

Chris Lambton and his team head to Blog Cabin 2016 to transform an unused area under the stilted house into a 
lounge that takes advantage of the gulf view; Chris builds a wood and metal pub table, then adds a fish cleaning 
island.

16:30 BEACHFRONT BARGAIN HUNT Repeat WS G

The One in Placencia 

A busy San Francisco family looks to purchase a relaxing vacation property in their favourite spot of Placencia, 
Belize, which is surrounded by a lagoon and the Caribbean Sea.

17:00 THE NATE AND JEREMIAH HOME 
PROJECT Repeat WS G

Every Dollar Counts Project 

A couple fell for the original charm of a crumbly 1920s colonial, but they need Nate and Jeremiah's help to make it 
functional for their family; before renovations begin, the duo must determine what stays from a collection of hand-
me-down furniture.
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18:00 HOUSE HUNTERS INTERNATIONAL Repeat WS G

Only the Best in Budapest 

A couple move their family and business from France to Hungary. They want plenty of space, but with a limited 
budget they may have to make some sacrifices.

18:30 HOUSE HUNTERS INTERNATIONAL Repeat WS G

Adjusting to Amsterdam 

A Pennsylvania couple take advantage of a job transfer to make their dream of living in Amsterdam a reality; they 
want something spacious with enough room for visiting family, but her wish list may prove to be too big for their one-
income budget.

19:00 HOUSE HUNTERS Repeat WS G

Off the Road Again 

A couple is ready to find a permanent home in Phoenix, Arizona, after living on the road for a year in their camper.

19:30 HOUSE HUNTERS INTERNATIONAL WS G

From Luxurious Dubai to London's Suburban Sprawl 

After 16 years in Dubai, a couple returns with their daughter to his native London; they're trading a life of pampered 
norms for suburban sprawl, but with big expectations and an even bigger dining table, it won't be an easy transition.

20:30 ISLAND OF BRYAN WS PG

Bring in the Troops 

The Bauemlers bring in extra support from home to help with the project; Sarah is left in charge of construction.

21:30 MY LOTTERY DREAM HOME 
INTERNATIONAL WS G

Winning Character 

A family inheritance means that a young couple can finally fulfill the dream of buying their first house. Now, 
Laurence's biggest challenge will be finding a home in quaint Wiltshire with as much character as the flamboyant, 
antique-obsessed twosome.

22:30 TBA Captioned WS G

Information To Follow.

23:30 HOUSE HUNTERS INTERNATIONAL Repeat WS G

Only the Best in Budapest 

A couple move their family and business from France to Hungary. They want plenty of space, but with a limited 
budget they may have to make some sacrifices.

00:00 HOUSE HUNTERS INTERNATIONAL Repeat WS G

Adjusting to Amsterdam 

A Pennsylvania couple take advantage of a job transfer to make their dream of living in Amsterdam a reality; they 
want something spacious with enough room for visiting family, but her wish list may prove to be too big for their one-
income budget.

00:30 HOUSE HUNTERS Repeat WS G

Off the Road Again 

A couple is ready to find a permanent home in Phoenix, Arizona, after living on the road for a year in their camper.
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Thu Jan 26, 2023

01:00 HOUSE HUNTERS INTERNATIONAL Repeat WS G

From Luxurious Dubai to London's Suburban Sprawl 

After 16 years in Dubai, a couple returns with their daughter to his native London; they're trading a life of pampered 
norms for suburban sprawl, but with big expectations and an even bigger dining table, it won't be an easy transition.

01:30 HOUSE HUNTERS INTERNATIONAL Repeat WS G

Texas Teacher to Costa Rica 

A Texas teacher decides to ditch her stressful teaching career for a more peaceful lifestyle in Costa Rica; she puts 
her entire life savings into her first home purchase, and on her tight budget, finding just the right place will be a 
challenge.

02:00 MY LOTTERY DREAM HOME 
INTERNATIONAL Repeat WS G

Winning Character 

A family inheritance means that a young couple can finally fulfill the dream of buying their first house. Now, 
Laurence's biggest challenge will be finding a home in quaint Wiltshire with as much character as the flamboyant, 
antique-obsessed twosome.

02:30 MY LOTTERY DREAM HOME 
INTERNATIONAL Repeat WS G

Seaside Prize 

After scoring $70,000 on a TV quiz show, a young couple has decided to put their winnings towards a house 
deposit. Laurence's challenge is to mix their modern taste and contemporary flair with the old-world charm of historic 
Leigh-on-Sea, Essex.

03:00 TBA Captioned WS G

Information To Follow.

04:00 MILLION DOLLAR LISTING NY Repeat WS M

Escape From New York 

When the city shuts down, the agents document their lives in lockdown. As the city opens back up, the agents learn 
how to navigate a new world – and a new market. 

Cons.Advice: Some Coarse Language

05:00 BLOG CABIN Repeat G

Blog Cabin 2016: Lower Lounge 

Chris Lambton and his team head to Blog Cabin 2016 to transform an unused area under the stilted house into a 
lounge that takes advantage of the gulf view; Chris builds a wood and metal pub table, then adds a fish cleaning 
island.

05:30 BEACHFRONT BARGAIN HUNT Repeat WS G

The One in Placencia 

A busy San Francisco family looks to purchase a relaxing vacation property in their favourite spot of Placencia, 
Belize, which is surrounded by a lagoon and the Caribbean Sea.
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Fri Jan 27, 2023

06:00 HOUSE HUNTERS INTERNATIONAL Repeat WS G

Adjusting to Amsterdam 

A Pennsylvania couple take advantage of a job transfer to make their dream of living in Amsterdam a reality; they 
want something spacious with enough room for visiting family, but her wish list may prove to be too big for their one-
income budget.

06:30 HOUSE HUNTERS Repeat WS G

Off the Road Again 

A couple is ready to find a permanent home in Phoenix, Arizona, after living on the road for a year in their camper.

07:00 GETAWAY Captioned Repeat WS PG

Scenic - AMBA #3 

This week on Getaway Nicky Buckley and husband Murray Bingham wind up their romantic Rhine and Moselle 
River cruise visiting Luxembourg, France and Germany's beautiful Black Forest. 

07:30 BLOG CABIN Repeat G

Blog Cabin 2016: Lower Lounge 

Chris Lambton and his team head to Blog Cabin 2016 to transform an unused area under the stilted house into a 
lounge that takes advantage of the gulf view; Chris builds a wood and metal pub table, then adds a fish cleaning 
island.

08:00 THE GARDEN GURUS Captioned Repeat WS G

Garden Guru Nigel Ruck explores one of Sydney's beautiful inner city gardens; Trevor shows us how to construct a 
hay bale garden and Melissa King looks at autumn's late harvesting vegetables.

08:30 THE BLOCK Captioned Repeat WS PG

Bedroom & Bathroom Week 

Luke and Jasmin are having a very bad day while Sarah and George have returned raring to go, Dan is shocked.

Cons.Advice: Mild Coarse Language

09:30 HOUSE HUNTERS INTERNATIONAL Repeat WS G

Only the Best in Budapest 

A couple move their family and business from France to Hungary. They want plenty of space, but with a limited 
budget they may have to make some sacrifices.

10:00 HOUSE HUNTERS INTERNATIONAL Repeat WS G

Adjusting to Amsterdam 

A Pennsylvania couple take advantage of a job transfer to make their dream of living in Amsterdam a reality; they 
want something spacious with enough room for visiting family, but her wish list may prove to be too big for their one-
income budget.

10:30 HOUSE HUNTERS Repeat WS G

Off the Road Again 

A couple is ready to find a permanent home in Phoenix, Arizona, after living on the road for a year in their camper.

11:00 HELLO SA Captioned Repeat WS PG

Bula Fiji 

Flying direct to Fiji from Adelaide has never been easier. We're off to Fiji and we're going to show you the highlights. 
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Fri Jan 27, 2023

11:30 HOUSE HUNTERS INTERNATIONAL Repeat WS G

From Luxurious Dubai to London's Suburban Sprawl 

After 16 years in Dubai, a couple returns with their daughter to his native London; they're trading a life of pampered 
norms for suburban sprawl, but with big expectations and an even bigger dining table, it won't be an easy transition.

12:00 HOUSE HUNTERS INTERNATIONAL Repeat WS G

Texas Teacher to Costa Rica 

A Texas teacher decides to ditch her stressful teaching career for a more peaceful lifestyle in Costa Rica; she puts 
her entire life savings into her first home purchase, and on her tight budget, finding just the right place will be a 
challenge.

12:30 TBA Captioned WS G

Information To Follow.

13:30 MY LOTTERY DREAM HOME 
INTERNATIONAL Repeat WS G

Winning Character 

A family inheritance means that a young couple can finally fulfill the dream of buying their first house. Now, 
Laurence's biggest challenge will be finding a home in quaint Wiltshire with as much character as the flamboyant, 
antique-obsessed twosome.

14:00 MY LOTTERY DREAM HOME 
INTERNATIONAL Repeat WS G

Seaside Prize 

After scoring $70,000 on a TV quiz show, a young couple has decided to put their winnings towards a house 
deposit. Laurence's challenge is to mix their modern taste and contemporary flair with the old-world charm of historic 
Leigh-on-Sea, Essex.

14:30 THE BLOCK Captioned Repeat WS PG

Bedroom & Bathroom Reveal 

Design inspiration all-round as the judges decide who takes home the $10,000 prize money for the best bedroom 
and bathroom. 

Cons.Advice: Mild Coarse Language

16:00 BLOG CABIN G

Blog Cabin 2016: Sky Cabin Side Yard 

Chris and his team descend on Blog Cabin 2016 to turn its empty side yard into a recreational area complete with a 
guest retreat, a two-tiered deck with custom lounge chairs and a sand volleyball court.

16:30 BEACHFRONT BARGAIN HUNT Repeat WS G

Best of Both Worlds in Bethany Beach 

A couple is ready to purchase a condo along the beaches of their favourite vacation spot of Bethany Beach, Del. 
because they both love the canal's access to boating, kayaking and paddle boarding.

17:00 ISLAND OF BRYAN Repeat WS PG

Bring in the Troops 

The Bauemlers bring in extra support from home to help with the project; Sarah is left in charge of construction.
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18:00 HOUSE HUNTERS INTERNATIONAL Repeat WS G

Assigned to Suffolk 

A military family follows a new assignment to Suffolk, England and can't agree on what kind of house will benefit 
them the most; she thinks a quaint English cottage would be perfect for the family, but he is only concerned with 
practicality.

18:30 HOUSE HUNTERS INTERNATIONAL Repeat WS G

Excess Baggage in Barbados 

A psychologist relocates her family for a teaching opportunity in Barbados; they're looking for a place with three 
bedrooms that's close to her work, but she wants something furnished while he's looking to bring the things they 
already own.

19:00 HOUSE HUNTERS Repeat WS G

A Fanboy Needs Space in LA 

A movie fan needs more space to display his memorabilia collection and he's determined to find it in San Fernando 
Valley, a pricier area of L.A.

19:30 YARD CRASHERS WS PG

Waterfall Oasis 

In Melanie and Ian's yard, Chris and the crew builds a granite and redwood bar table with an adjoining prep station; 
the crew constructs a fire pit, adds a rock waterfall and designs a secret garden for the couple's pets.

20:30 OFF THE GRID ON THE BEACH Repeat WS G

Hectic Lives to Beachfront Vibes 

A couple looks to buy a vacation home on the beach in Nova Scotia to escape their busy lifestyles; they'll need to 
use lobster boats and helicopters to travel to get their dream home.

21:30 BUILDING OFF THE GRID Repeat WS PG

Colorado Earth House 

Two renovators have purchased land in remote Colorado to build a new home away from home. They've decided on 
a one of a kind build, using a rammed earth process to construct all natural walls. But when winter comes early, they 
soon realise this process is far more laborious than they first anticipated.

22:30 LAKEFRONT BARGAIN HUNT Repeat WS G

A home by the water in Pennsylvania's aquatic playground, Blakeslee, PA. 

Kasey and Dave lead busy lives in Lehigh Valley, PA, dreaming of spending outdoor summers splashing around 
with their four kids in a vacation property of their own. Just an hour from home, they have fallen for Blakeslee, PA, a 
water lover's wonderland nestled in the Pocono Mountains.

23:30 SHAHS OF SUNSET WS MA

A Nightmare on Destiney's Street 

Halloween is the scariest time of the year, and with the Shahs still very much a fractured bunch, Destiney's 
upcoming party might be more "trick" than "treat." During Elijah and Shams' first play date, GG helps MJ realize that 
Reza needs uplifting, leading to an emotional meeting between the lifelong friends. Destiney finds herself sinking 
deeper into Mike's relationship drama when Paulina reveals dirty secrets about her man. Paulina makes Destiney 
swear to not say a word, setting up a potentially turbulent holiday gathering for the group.

Cons.Advice: Mature Themes, Some Coarse Language, Sexual References
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Fri Jan 27, 2023

00:30 HOUSE HUNTERS INTERNATIONAL Repeat WS G

Assigned to Suffolk 

A military family follows a new assignment to Suffolk, England and can't agree on what kind of house will benefit 
them the most; she thinks a quaint English cottage would be perfect for the family, but he is only concerned with 
practicality.

01:00 THE REAL HOUSEWIVES OF ORANGE 
COUNTY Repeat WS M

Italian Night Fight 

Vicki sets the record straight after Kelly continues to tell stories about Steve; Gina's parents visit from Long Island; 
Vicki throws an Italian-themed party; an overwhelmed Gina sneaks off to the bathroom to call an unexpected person 
for help.

Cons.Advice: Some Coarse Language, Sexual References

02:00 OFF THE GRID ON THE BEACH Repeat WS G

Hectic Lives to Beachfront Vibes 

A couple looks to buy a vacation home on the beach in Nova Scotia to escape their busy lifestyles; they'll need to 
use lobster boats and helicopters to travel to get their dream home.

02:30 OFF THE GRID ON THE BEACH Repeat WS G

Busy Highways to Big Waves 

Two friends look for a private beach home in Costa Rica; the guys are looking for empty beaches and big waves, 
and they have to take off road vehicles, boats and even horses to find the perfect spot to hang their surf boards.

03:00 BUILDING OFF THE GRID Repeat WS PG

Colorado Earth House 

Two renovators have purchased land in remote Colorado to build a new home away from home. They've decided on 
a one of a kind build, using a rammed earth process to construct all natural walls. But when winter comes early, they 
soon realise this process is far more laborious than they first anticipated.

04:00 YARD CRASHERS Repeat WS PG

Waterfall Oasis 

In Melanie and Ian's yard, Chris and the crew builds a granite and redwood bar table with an adjoining prep station; 
the crew constructs a fire pit, adds a rock waterfall and designs a secret garden for the couple's pets.

04:30 YARD CRASHERS Repeat WS PG

Mid Century Modern Makeover 

A couple wants to transform their messy yard into a modern space for entertaining with a large dining space.

05:00 BLOG CABIN Repeat G

Blog Cabin 2016: Sky Cabin Side Yard 

Chris and his team descend on Blog Cabin 2016 to turn its empty side yard into a recreational area complete with a 
guest retreat, a two-tiered deck with custom lounge chairs and a sand volleyball court.

05:30 BEACHFRONT BARGAIN HUNT Repeat WS G

Best of Both Worlds in Bethany Beach 

A couple is ready to purchase a condo along the beaches of their favourite vacation spot of Bethany Beach, Del. 
because they both love the canal's access to boating, kayaking and paddle boarding.
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06:00 HOUSE HUNTERS INTERNATIONAL Repeat WS G

Excess Baggage in Barbados 

A psychologist relocates her family for a teaching opportunity in Barbados; they're looking for a place with three 
bedrooms that's close to her work, but she wants something furnished while he's looking to bring the things they 
already own.

06:30 HOUSE HUNTERS Repeat WS G

A Fanboy Needs Space in LA 

A movie fan needs more space to display his memorabilia collection and he's determined to find it in San Fernando 
Valley, a pricier area of L.A.

07:00 YARD CRASHERS Repeat WS PG

Waterfall Oasis 

In Melanie and Ian's yard, Chris and the crew builds a granite and redwood bar table with an adjoining prep station; 
the crew constructs a fire pit, adds a rock waterfall and designs a secret garden for the couple's pets.

07:30 YARD CRASHERS Repeat WS PG

Mid Century Modern Makeover 

A couple wants to transform their messy yard into a modern space for entertaining with a large dining space.

08:00 THE BLOCK Captioned Repeat WS PG

Bedroom & Bathroom Reveal 

Design inspiration all-round as the judges decide who takes home the $10,000 prize money for the best bedroom 
and bathroom. 

Cons.Advice: Mild Coarse Language

09:30 HOUSE HUNTERS INTERNATIONAL Repeat WS G

Assigned to Suffolk 

A military family follows a new assignment to Suffolk, England and can't agree on what kind of house will benefit 
them the most; she thinks a quaint English cottage would be perfect for the family, but he is only concerned with 
practicality.

10:00 HOUSE HUNTERS INTERNATIONAL Repeat WS G

Excess Baggage in Barbados 

A psychologist relocates her family for a teaching opportunity in Barbados; they're looking for a place with three 
bedrooms that's close to her work, but she wants something furnished while he's looking to bring the things they 
already own.

10:30 HOUSE HUNTERS Repeat WS G

A Fanboy Needs Space in LA 

A movie fan needs more space to display his memorabilia collection and he's determined to find it in San Fernando 
Valley, a pricier area of L.A.

11:00 BLOG CABIN Repeat G

Blog Cabin 2016: Sky Cabin Side Yard 

Chris and his team descend on Blog Cabin 2016 to turn its empty side yard into a recreational area complete with a 
guest retreat, a two-tiered deck with custom lounge chairs and a sand volleyball court.
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11:30 BEACHFRONT BARGAIN HUNT Repeat WS G

Best of Both Worlds in Bethany Beach 

A couple is ready to purchase a condo along the beaches of their favourite vacation spot of Bethany Beach, Del. 
because they both love the canal's access to boating, kayaking and paddle boarding.

12:00 GETAWAY Captioned Repeat WS PG

Scenic - AMBA #3 

This week on Getaway Nicky Buckley and husband Murray Bingham wind up their romantic Rhine and Moselle 
River cruise visiting Luxembourg, France and Germany's beautiful Black Forest. 

12:30 LAKEFRONT BARGAIN HUNT Repeat WS G

A home by the water in Pennsylvania's aquatic playground, Blakeslee, PA. 

Kasey and Dave lead busy lives in Lehigh Valley, PA, dreaming of spending outdoor summers splashing around 
with their four kids in a vacation property of their own. Just an hour from home, they have fallen for Blakeslee, PA, a 
water lover's wonderland nestled in the Pocono Mountains.

13:00 LAKEFRONT BARGAIN HUNT Repeat WS G

A Couple is Ready to Trade in Their Apartment for a Waterfront Home on Lake Winnebago, Wisconsin 

Aaron and Keri are ready to get out of their tiny apartment, especially with the new addition to their family, their baby 
boy. They love the town of Oshkosh, Wisconsin but want to live closer to the water so they can enjoy the calming 
views and active lifestyle. 

13:30 OFF THE GRID ON THE BEACH Repeat WS G

Hectic Lives to Beachfront Vibes 

A couple looks to buy a vacation home on the beach in Nova Scotia to escape their busy lifestyles; they'll need to 
use lobster boats and helicopters to travel to get their dream home.

14:00 OFF THE GRID ON THE BEACH Repeat WS G

Busy Highways to Big Waves 

Two friends look for a private beach home in Costa Rica; the guys are looking for empty beaches and big waves, 
and they have to take off road vehicles, boats and even horses to find the perfect spot to hang their surf boards.

14:30 FARMHOUSE FACELIFT Repeat WS G

Farmhouse Dream Come True 

Billy and Carolyn transform a tired farmhouse into the perfect place to host family and friends.

15:30 ISLAND OF BRYAN Repeat WS PG

Bring in the Troops 

The Bauemlers bring in extra support from home to help with the project; Sarah is left in charge of construction.

16:30 HOLMES FAMILY RESCUE Repeat WS PG

Color Crisis 

The Holmes family steps up when their electrician and good friend, Frank, gets overwhelmed with his renovation 
due to a series of health issues; The design choices and fun finishes at a client's bungalow leave Mike having a 
crisis of colour.
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17:30 YARD CRASHERS Repeat WS PG

Waterfall Oasis 

In Melanie and Ian's yard, Chris and the crew builds a granite and redwood bar table with an adjoining prep station; 
the crew constructs a fire pit, adds a rock waterfall and designs a secret garden for the couple's pets.
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18:00 YARD CRASHERS Repeat WS PG

Mid Century Modern Makeover 

A couple wants to transform their messy yard into a modern space for entertaining with a large dining space.

18:30 BUILDING OFF THE GRID Repeat WS PG

Colorado Earth House 

Two renovators have purchased land in remote Colorado to build a new home away from home. They've decided on 
a one of a kind build, using a rammed earth process to construct all natural walls. But when winter comes early, they 
soon realise this process is far more laborious than they first anticipated.

19:30 ESCAPE TO THE CHATEAU Captioned Repeat WS G

Camper Van 

With only one more wedding to host for the summer, Dick and Angel open their doors to a fleet of vintage Citroens 
on a charity tour around France. Afterwards, Dick and Angel can focus on their own retro vehicle: the 1980s Asquith 
bus.

20:30 HOUSE HUNTERS WS G

An Ex-Sarge Wants X-Large 

After a lifetime of traveling, an Air Force veteran and her teen son are moving back to Huntsville, Alabama.

21:00 HOUSE HUNTERS Repeat WS G

Turning a Negative Into a Positive 

A North Carolina couple makes the best of a negative situation by buying their first home after being displaced from 
their rental by a hurricane. However, she wants to settle down in a move-in ready home, but he's looking to build 
equity in a fixer.

21:30 HOUSE HUNTERS INTERNATIONAL Repeat WS G

New Baby, New Town, New Rules in Canberra 

A U.S. soldier, his pregnant wife, and their toddler are moving from Hanoi, Vietnam to Canberra, Australia for his 
new station in the military.

22:30 BEACHFRONT BARGAIN HUNT 
RENOVATION Repeat WS G

Westport Wonder 

A couple's budget may hinder the renovation of their Westport, West Virginia retreat.

23:30 HOUSE HUNTERS WS G

An Ex-Sarge Wants X-Large 

After a lifetime of traveling, an Air Force veteran and her teen son are moving back to Huntsville, Alabama.

00:00 REAL HOUSEWIVES OF ATLANTA: 
PORSHA'S FAMILY MATTERS WS M

Spilling the Tea-Quila 

As the family vacation continues, Dennis pleads with the family to look out for Porsha. Lauren holds Porsha 
accountable for her actions, and a day of fun leads to an unexpected night that may destroy Porsha's hopes for a 
blended family.

Cons.Advice: Some Coarse Language, Sexual References
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01:00 LAKEFRONT BARGAIN HUNT Repeat WS G

A home by the water in Pennsylvania's aquatic playground, Blakeslee, PA. 

Kasey and Dave lead busy lives in Lehigh Valley, PA, dreaming of spending outdoor summers splashing around 
with their four kids in a vacation property of their own. Just an hour from home, they have fallen for Blakeslee, PA, a 
water lover's wonderland nestled in the Pocono Mountains.

01:30 LAKEFRONT BARGAIN HUNT Repeat WS G

A Couple is Ready to Trade in Their Apartment for a Waterfront Home on Lake Winnebago, Wisconsin 

Aaron and Keri are ready to get out of their tiny apartment, especially with the new addition to their family, their baby 
boy. They love the town of Oshkosh, Wisconsin but want to live closer to the water so they can enjoy the calming 
views and active lifestyle. 

02:00 HOUSE HUNTERS INTERNATIONAL Repeat WS G

New Baby, New Town, New Rules in Canberra 

A U.S. soldier, his pregnant wife, and their toddler are moving from Hanoi, Vietnam to Canberra, Australia for his 
new station in the military.

02:30 HOUSE HUNTERS INTERNATIONAL Repeat WS G

Honeymooners in Perth 

A newlywed couple looks for a change and takes a job opportunity in Perth, Australia. They're looking for three 
bedrooms, a modern kitchen and space for guests, but finding their ideal location may be a challenge.

03:00 BEACHFRONT BARGAIN HUNT 
RENOVATION Repeat WS G

Westport Wonder 

A couple's budget may hinder the renovation of their Westport, West Virginia retreat.

04:00 REAL HOUSEWIVES OF ATLANTA: 
PORSHA'S FAMILY MATTERS Repeat WS M

Spilling the Tea-Quila 

As the family vacation continues, Dennis pleads with the family to look out for Porsha. Lauren holds Porsha 
accountable for her actions, and a day of fun leads to an unexpected night that may destroy Porsha's hopes for a 
blended family.

Cons.Advice: Some Coarse Language, Sexual References

05:00 THE REAL HOUSEWIVES OF ORANGE 
COUNTY Repeat WS M

Italian Night Fight 

Vicki sets the record straight after Kelly continues to tell stories about Steve; Gina's parents visit from Long Island; 
Vicki throws an Italian-themed party; an overwhelmed Gina sneaks off to the bathroom to call an unexpected person 
for help.

Cons.Advice: Some Coarse Language, Sexual References

PLEASE NOTE: This document and its contents are embargoed until 9:00 AM Sunday 15 January 2023. 
This document is confidential and is the copyright of Nine Network Australia Pty. Ltd. This document or 
its contents must not be disclosed or released to any third party before the Embargo Date.

Page 29 of 29

Sydney Program Guide


